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Relations between Türkiye and the Peoples Republic of China (PRC) began in 1971 under 
the influence of Cold War conditions. These relations, however, were overshadowed 
during the 1980s and 1990s by different views of the parties on various international 
issues such the Uyghur Question and particularly Cyprus Question.[1] In the 1980s, a 
cooperation agreement was signed in the field of economy and industry and the first high-
level official visits took place. In 1990s, alongside the Uyghur Question, the foreign policy 
approach developed by Türkiye with the end of the Cold War era regarding the new states 
formed as a result of the dissolution of Yugoslavia and the Soviet Union led to some 
disputes in relations with China.[2] Beginning in the mid-1990s, high level contacs were 
made again. In 1998 Türkiye restricted the activities of Uyghur associations and the 
impact of the Uyghur issue in the Türkiye-China relations subsequently decreased.[3] With 
the effect of China's integration into the global trade system in the 2000s, the relations 
between the two countries have gained momentum in the economic and commercial 
fields. Various economic cooperation issues such as mining activities, high-speed train 
project, and China's proposal to enter into a nuclear power plant tender between Türkiye 
and China were raised in this period.[4]

Events in The Urumqi events in the year 2009 had negative impact on Türkiye and China 
relations. Since 2010, relations between the two countries have started to get closer again 
with high-level visits. First, Chinese Premier Wen Jiabao visited Türkiye in 2010 and Xi 
Jinping- the-Chinese Vice President at that time-visited Türkiye in 2012. In 2012 and 2019, 
Turkish President Recep Tayyip Erdogan visited Beijing, and also Mr. Erdogan and Mr. Xi 
met during BRICS and G20 Summits. The most important development in this period was 
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the signing of the Joint Declaration on Strategic Cooperation Relations in 2010. The goals 
of this Declaration are to strengthen economic relations, overcome political 
disagreements, and develop a common global vision.[5] China, which prefers to establish 
hierarchical partnerships by using more than forty different classifications instead of 
traditional alliance relations in its diplomatic relations, has defined its relations with 
Türkiye as a "strategic partnership.[6] Thus, economic and political relations between 
Türkiye and China have begun to strengthen since the 2010s. The Chinese Ministry of 
Foreign Affairs states that 2013 was the year in which relations between the two countries 
gained momentum.[7] 2013 marks the year when Chinese President Xi announced his 
signature initiative; the Belt and Road Initiative (BRI). From this perspective, it can be 
argued that the economic factor playing a role in the rapprochement between Türkiye and 
China during those years was the announcement of the BRI. The BRI is shaped around 
principles such as connectivity, win-win cooperation, people-to-people bonds, and 
civilizational partnership. It aims to provide regional integration between China and BRI 
participant countries through infrastructure investments, creating economic corridors, 
trade routes, logistics centers, underwater communication cables, and digital networks, 
alongside the Economic Belt of the Silk Road and the 21st Century Maritime Silk Road, as 
well as the Arctic Silk Road and the Digital Silk Road.

In 2015, China announced the BRI Vision Document, and Türkiye became a participant in 
the same year. The BRI consists of a fragmented structure based on the principle of 
aligning the long-term economic and commercial vision goals of participant countries with 
Chinas objectives. In this context, the infrastructure investments that were brought up 
between the two countries in the early 2000s have re-emerged, and Türkiye has sought to 
align its vision and goals accordingly. Türkiye's "Trans-Caspian-Middle Corridor" project, 
with its complementary feature in terms of the China-Europe connection, has been 
harmonized through the agreement signed between the two countries in 2015 with the 
BRI and Türkiye's "Middle Corridor" project.[8] Türkiye participated in the Belt and Road 
Summit held in 2017 and became one of the founding members of the Asian 
Infrastructure Investment Bank.[9] In 2017, the Baku-Tbilisi-Kars railway became 
operational, and in 2019, the first freight train service between Türkiye and China was 
commenced in December 2020.[10] Other investments made by China in Türkiye under 
the BRI can be include the Ankara-Istanbul high-speed train project implemented by China 
Railway Construction Co., İstanbul Kağıthana-Airport railway implemented by CRRC 
Zhuzhou Locomotive Co., and Kumport port acquired by a tripartite consortium consisting 
of COSCO Shipping Port Ltd, China Merchants Port Holding and China Investment 
Corporation.[11]

When we examine the political factors that play a role in the convergence of Türkiye and 
China relations in recent times, we can observe that there are systemic and regional 
developments that are causing the two countries to become closer. First of all, 
developments such as the US-China competition in the international system, efforts for 
multipolarity, and the increasing influence of new formations such as BRICS have all 
created new areas of cooperation for Türkiye as a regional power. On the other hand, it is 
being argued that some of the problems Türkiye has with the West have caused it to 
become closer to China and accelerate its cooperation.[12] It should be noted that Türkiye 

AVİM Avrasya İncelemeleri Merkezi
Center for Eurasian Studies 2



and China have some differences of opinion on international issues such as the Cyprus 
Question, the Syrian War, and cross-border operations. However, despite the stated 
differences of opinion, as can be seen from the recent high-level mutual visits, both sides 
desire to develop economic and trade relations.

With the effect of the BRIs initiation, and under the leadership of different actors as a 
reflection of the geopolitical and geoeconomic competition in the international system, 
new economic and commercial corridors, port and infrastructure investments such as 
EASTMED, IMEC, Build Back Better World  (B3W), Development Road have been proposed. 
On the other hand, cases such as the Russia-Ukraine War, the October 7 Gaza War and in 
its aftermath, and the attacks in the Red Sea that have disrupted global maritime trade 
have all caused impediments for some economic corridors, especially the Northern 
Corridor of BRI and EASTMED. In this contex, as mentioned in previous article published 
by AVİM, the Middle Corridor continues to provide a safer route specially in terms of BRI 
and Türkiye-China relations.

Another development at the regional level is that the developments in the Turkish military 
forces and the defense industry have brought new military and security cooperation with 
regional countries such as Kazakhstan and Uzbekistan after the Karabakh War.[13]
Similarly, China is closely following the Turkish defense industry, as can be seen by its 
interest in the recently held Turkish defense industry exhibition.[14] In this context, 
Türkiye has improved its close political, economic and cultural relations with the Central 
Asian countries, as well as its military and security relations. Considering its 
multidimensional relations with the Central Asian countries within the framework of the 
Organization of Turkic States and the Turkic World Vision 2040, Türkiye stands out as an 
actor that will strengthen Chinese relations with the Central Asian countries.

High level contacts between Türkiye and China continued during 2023 and 2024. During 
the visit of Chinese Foreign Minister Wang Yi to Ankara in 2023, the establishment of a 
High-Level Working Group Meeting to accelerate the harmonization of the Middle Corridor 
and the BRI was discussed. The Turkish Minister of Foreign Affairs Fidan, in his speech 
during a visit to Beijing in July 2024, emphasizing Türkiyes geostrategic position, stated 
that it provided to access opportunities within a large value market worth 28 trillion 
stretching from Central Asia to Europe. These statements are an indication that China can 
benefit from this access opportunity thanks to Türkiye. Mr. Fidan drew attention to the 
harmony between the Middle Corridor and BRI and emphasized the importance of also 
creating harmony by taking advantage of the connectivity between the Development 
Road and the BRI.[15] In this context, if the integration of the Development Road with the 
Middle Corridor is achieved, it is possible for Türkiye to contribute to trade with Chinese 
trade relations with the Middle East as well as Central Asia. During President Erdogan's 
meeting with President Xi during the SCO summit in July 2024, the sides discussed the 
willingness fort he Chinese enterprises to increase their investments in Türkiye and 
promoting of bilateral tourism relations.[16] In addition, there are opportunities for 
cooperation in green areas such as solar power plants, offshore wind turbines, and 
nuclear energy, in which China is a pioneer.[17]

Another dimension of bilateral relations in the recent period is the issue of Türkiye's BRICS 
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membership. BRICS, which took steps in the field of finance by establishing a new 
Development Bank in 2015 and by encouraging the use of national currencies, has 
increased the number of members as a result of experiencing its second expansion due to 
the South Africa Summit in 2023. Thus, BRICS has become an important dialogue platform 
representing a significant part of the Global South in terms of population and economy. 
The announcement that more than thirty countries, including countries such as Malaysia 
and Sri Lanka, are preparing to participate in the BRICS summit, which will take place in 
Kazan between October 22-24, has made BRICS the center of attraction in the 
international system. China, which is an important member of the BRICS and defines itself 
as a developing country, brings some criticism to the current international political 
system, especially the UN, the global financial and trade system, and advocates a system 
in which developing countries have more of a say. Instead of approaching platforms and 
organizations such as the BRICS and the SCO through identity and security, Türkiye sees 
them as a complement to its existing policies by approaching them as a new area of 
cooperation. In addition, China tends to advance its relations with other countries through 
economic and trade cooperation. In this context, it is possible to suggest that BRICS 
membership will offer more economic and trade gains in terms of Türkiye-China relations. 
Another development reported in the press is that Chinese President Xi will visit Türkiye in 
2025. The developments mentioned in this direction indicate that steps are being taken to 
accelerate BRI investments and thus develop trade between the two countries.

When the obstacles to relations between Türkiye and China are examined, it is seen that 
first of all, these relations are hampered by negative images existing in social memories 
due to the fact that they started under the shadow of competing blocs shaped by Cold 
War conditions. Additionally the Uyghur Question has negatively affected the political 
relations between the two countries on multiplr occasions.[18] While Yu thinks that 
political consensus is necessary for the solution of the problem, Atlı suggests that close 
economic relations will help in the solution.[19]

Another problem is related to BRI. Firstly, within the framework of the Twenty-First 
Century Maritime Silk Road, it is noted that significant collaboration between Türkiye and 
China, particularly regarding port investments, has not been adequately established. In 
the study in which Gurel and Kozluca examined BRI investments, it is suggested that 
Chinese investments remain weak compared to other commercial partners of Türkiye.[20]
Moreover, the Middle Corridor, which has been the focus of economic and trade relations 
between the two countries in recent years and which has been harmonized with the BRI, 
has not yet reached the expected trade volume. This was highlighted in Turkish Minister 
of Foreign Affairs Fidan's speech during his visit to Beijing, when he stated that the Middle 
Corridor was lagging behind its economic potential. The main reason why the Middle 
Corridor, which offers an important economic market opportunity, cannot achieve its goal, 
is related to a several bureaucratic obstacles, especially the customs legislation between 
the two countries. In this context, the elimination of the existing bureaucratic obstacles, 
will bring the relations between Türkiye and China to upper levels. At the same time, it will 
make a significant contribution to Chinese trade by strengthening China's ties with Europe 
via Central Asia through Türkiye. In addition, close social, cultural, political, and security 
relations between the Middle Corridor participant countries and Türkiye, can also 
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contribute to strengthening people-to-people bonds, another important principle of BRI.

Another obstacle is the foreign trade deficit against China, which has become Türkiye's 
third largest commercial partner by 2024. The increasing volume and competitiveness of 
China, which has become the second largest economy in global trade, has been effective 
in this case. It has been stated that the relatively limited volume of Türkiye's export items 
and the presence of Turkish and Chinese companies in similar sectors such as textiles and 
infrastructure are other factors that negatively affect the trade relations between the two 
countries.[21] In order to make its trade with Asian countries, especially China, more 
balanced, Türkiye announced the Asia Anew Initiative after the Turkish President's visit to 
Beijing in 2019.[22] The new initiateive aims to increase infrastructure investments, 
develop the trade through activities such as high-tech products and cultural business 
associations.[23]

As a result, although there are some political issues between the two countries in the 
context of international challenges and national policies from time to time, Türkiye 
approaches its relations with China in terms of a policy of strategic autonomy. It seeks to 
achieve economic gains through various Chinese investments by enhancing its 
cooperation and commercial integration. Similarly, thanks to the alignment of the BRI and 
the Middle Corridor, close economic and trade relations with Türkiye offer the opportunity 
for China to reach the West through the Central Asian countries and Türkiye. Thus, it is 
clear to suggest that the relations between the two countries have complementary 
characteristics.
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