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For some time the armament activities of the Greek Cypriot Administration of Southern 
Cyprus, which exceed the purpose of defence, have been increasing rapidly and are 
constituting a risk of threatening the region. The Greek Administration, which is striving to 
turn the Island of Cyprus into an armory, daftly continues to increase these activities at a 
rapid pace.

In just this year alone, the Greek Administration has reinforced its land and naval 
capabilities through purchasing heavy weaponry from Serbia and Germany and two deep 
sea steamers from France. Within this scope, the Greek Cypriot Administration of 
Southern Cyprus has concluded agreements to buy eight Milosh BOV M16 4x4 armored 
combat vehicles (TOMA) that can be used for patrolling, scouting, personnel transporting, 
as an ambulance and twenty four 155 NORA B-52 towed guns from Serbia, as well as 41 
Leopard 2A4 type tanks from Germany.

As the armament activities were continuing, last week a letter of intent aimed at 
broadening the strategic cooperation was signed between the Greek Cypriot 
Administration of Southern Cyprus and France with the purpose of strengthening the 
Greek Cypriot navy and developing the two countries navies capabilities to serve their 
goals. Based on this letter, the Greek Cypriot Administration of Southern Cyprus is 
preparing to allocate a permanent naval base to France.

As is known, there is a defence agreement between the Greek Cypriot Administration of 
Southern Cyprus and France with the aim of strengthening the security cooperation. This 
agreement is being continuously developed and within this framework the Greek Cypriot 
Administration of Southern Cyprus is rapidly increasing its weapons and military potential.

According to the media reports, the recently signed letter of intent consists of nine 
articles. The articles are as follows:

1. The transformation of the naval base into a base with a highly operational range,
2. Following the completion of the research and planning regarding the development of 

the naval base, making it operational within six months,
3. All the requirements of the French naval forces, which will harbor at and carry out 

operations in the Eastern Meditterranean under the framework of the PESCO 
cooperation, will be fully met,
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4. Permanent presence of France in the region will be secured,
5. The operational infrastructure of the Greek Cypriot Administration of Southern 

Cyprus will be used as viable knowledge power for the French naval forces that will 
be operating in the region,

6. France will economically contribute to the development of the infrastructure of the 
naval base in Mari which will serve its fleet,

7. The French naval forces will resist any attempts of Turkey to hamper the Total 
companys research activities,

8. The modernization and reinforcement of the naval forces of the Greek Cypriot 
Administration of Southern Cyprus,

9. Ensuring the cooperation and training of the two countries armed forces within the 
framework of European or bilateral activities.

 

As it can be understood from this data, the efforts mentioned above have the 
characteristics that exceedingly go beyond the purpose of defence. The armament 
activities as if to almost target the Turkish Republic of Northern Cyprus and its close 
neighbor the Republic of Turkey constitute a threat and are provocative steps that pose 
as obstacles to the establishment of trust between the two sides. Within this scope, the 
attitude of France adopted against Turkey and expressed in the seventh article of the 
above mentioned text, which is not in conformity with the allied spirit between the two 
countries, is especially noteworthy.

In addition to this, the Greek Cypriot Administration of Southern Cyprus has also made 
diplomatic and political attempts with a view to the lifting of the arms embargo that has 
been implemented by the US on the Greek Cypriot Administration of Southern Cyprus 
since 1987 so that the peace and stability atmosphere in the island would not turn into 
tension. The members of the Senate and House of Representatives of the US Congress, 
which have been trying since their election to further the interests of Greece and the 
Cypriot Greeks, have presented a bill, which foresees the lifting of the arms sale ban 
enforced on the Greek Cypriot Administration of Southern Cyprus.

The armament activities of the Greek Cypriot Administration reveal the Cypriot Greek 
leaderships real vision for the future of the island and demonstrate high level of hostility 
unseen for a long time. At this point, it would be good for the regional security if the 
Greek Administration halts these activities before it is too late.

To what end all of these purchases that exceed the purpose of defence and initiatives to 
rally supporters are made and what are the real aims of the Greek Cypriot Administration 
of Southern Cyprus must be questioned. We condemn this approach and consider it our 
duty to call upon the people, institutions and countries that support these initiatives to act 
with decency and prudence.

These initiatives will not serve the regional peace, security and stability and will have no 
meaning other than warmongering. The Greek Cypriot Administration of Southern Cyprus 
and its supporters should take constructive steps towards a permanent and fair resolution 
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of the Cyprus issue instead of continuing armament efforts. Otherwise, neither regional 
nor global peace and stability will be possible due to the uncompromising posture of the 
Greek Cypriot administration.

It is hereby also clear that the unfair isolation and unjust actions faced by the Turkish 
Cypriot people for many years now should come to an end. In this respect, it is obvious 
that there is a need greater than ever for prudent and cooperative efforts in order to 
establish a just and lasting peace on the island.
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